Coutere Recion MECcHANICAL
ContrAcTORS INC.

r N : 2255 Palace Street Office * (508) 783-6950 BN
. q [ 4 La Crosse, WI 54603 Fax * (608) 783-6952
Q A

September 19, 2016

To: La Crosse Center
Re: Water heater

Attn: Den

Don,

We propose to remove old water heater and install a new BTH 250 — 100 gallon water heater.
PRICE IS A NOT TO EXCEED $7,200.00

Please call with any questions

Sincerely,

COULEE REGION MECHAN%CAL CONTRACTORS, INC.

Bill Lanzel




\

BERNIE J. BUCHNER, INC.

‘ Plumbing - Heating - Air Conditioning 1
| 224 Causeway Blvd La Crosse, Wl 54603 - 3196 |
| Phone (608) 784 - 9000 Fax (608) 784 - 4884

. PROPOSAL SUBMITTED TO: PHONE DATE

| City of La Crosse 9-21-2016

| STREET JOB NAME

| 300 Harborview Plz. Water Heater Replacement

| CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE JOB LOCATION

| La Crosse, WI 54603 La Crosse Civic Center
ATTENTION DATE OF PLANS JOB PHONE
Don Rackow

We hereby submit specifications and estimates for:

Don for the replacement of a BTH 250 100Gal AO Smith cyclone water heater. We will
remove and dispose of existing water heater. A new BTH 250 100 gallon natural gas unit will
be installed. Price will include all material, labor, tax and permit.

Price: $9,550.00

We Propose hereby to furnish material and labor -- complete in accordance with above specifications, for the sum of:
See Above

Payment is made as follows:
Upon Completion

All material is guaranteed to be as specified. All work to be completed in a workmanlike manner
| according to standard practices. Any alteration or deviation from above specifications including Authorized Signature
| exira costs will be executed only upon written orders, and will become an extra charge over

and above the estimate. All agreements contingent upon strikes, accidents or delays beyond Ryan Demi

our control. Owner to carry fire, tornado, and other necessary insurance. Our workers are fully
covered by Worker's Compensation Insurance.

NOTE: This propesal may be withdrawn by us if not accepted within ___ 30 days.

ACCEPTANCE OF PROPOSAL - The above prices, specifications and conditions are
satisfactory and are hereby accepted. You are authorized to do the work as specified. Payment SIGNATURE
will be made as cutlined above.

Date of Acceptance
SIGNATURE




Salzwedel, Kris
==
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From: Rackow, Donald
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 8:29 AM
To: Salzwedel, Kris
Subject: FW: Lacrosse Center Water Heater estimate

From: Steve King [mailto:Steve@niebuhrplumbing.com]
Sent: Monday, September 19, 2016 2:46 PM

To: Rackow, Donald

Subject: RE: Lacrosse Center Water Heater estimate

Thanks for reaching out, we will not be bidding on this heater.

Steve King

From: Rackow, Donald [mailto:drackow@lacrossecenter.com]
Sent: Monday, September 19, 2016 11:40 AM

To: Steve King

Subject: Lacrosse Center Water Heater estimate

Good Morning Steve | am again looking for an estimate to install another water heater | am sending you pictures of the
project. In one on the pictures you see both an old on the left and a new one on the right and it is the left one that is in
need of replacement.

Don Rackow
Building Engineer



