
Evaluation Criteria: Determine Funds Available (Approximately $26,000,000.00)

Use Highest Bidder First Down to the Lowest Bidder

No More Than $10,000,000 to Any One Bidder

Bidder 1,000,000.00  2,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 4,000,000.00 5,000,000.00  6,000,000.00  7,000,000.00   8,000,000.00   9,000,000.00 10,000,000.00 

2019 Results:

Associated Bank 0.0005 500.00            1,000.00        1,500.00        

BMO Harris decline 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Bremer Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Citizens 0.0007 0 0 2,100.00        2,800.00        3,500.00         4,200.00         4,900.00          0 0 0

Coulee Bank 0.0026 2,600.00         5,200.00        7,800.00        10,400.00      13,000.00       15,600.00       18,200.00        0 0 0

Coulee Bank 0.0018 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 14,400.00        16,200.00      18,000.00        

Park Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

River Bank 0.0021 2,100.00         4,200.00        6,300.00        8,400.00        10,500.00       12,600.00       14,700.00        16,800.00        18,900.00      21,000.00        

State Bank Financial 0.0022 2,200.00         4,400.00        6,600.00        8,800.00        11,000.00       13,200.00       15,400.00        17,600.00        19,800.00      22,000.00        

US Bank decline 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Wells Fargo decline 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

First National Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Merchants Bank decline 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Seven Bridges Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Union State Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

First Federal Capital Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

First National Bank of Bangor No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

M&I Bank No Bid 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
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