Reinhart, David

From: Braden Busch <bradenbusch01@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 17, 2022 7:48 AM

To: Reinhart, David

Subject: Re: Shoveling Fees
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*** CAUTION: This email originated from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe. ***

Sorry | am sick and my head is just not working right.

The reason for the dispute is that | was not aware that | was being charged. With things like parking tickets, you are
made aware. Had | known | got charged, no way would | have made the mistake of not shoveling again. | just really think
the city could make tickets just like they do for parking and stick them to people's doors to at least make them aware at

the time of it happening.

| cannot afford a $760 random bill, and I'm sure 75% of La Crosse residents can't either. | will have to take on a loan or
credit card to pay that.

Lastly, | travel out of town every weekend, for days at a time. Am | supposed to travel back if it snows?

Sorry if I'm sounding rude. You were calm on the phone and | appreciate that. | am just scared because | don't know how
to pay this.

On Thu, Feb 17, 2022, 7:25 AM Reinhart, David <Reinhartd @cityoflacrosse.org> wrote:

Braden,

What is the reason for the dispute??

Thanks.

David Reinhart

Chief Building Inspector
La Crosse Fire Department

Division of Community Risk Management

400 La Crosse St., La Crosse, WI. 54601



Office: 608-789-7564
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From: Braden Busch <bradenbusch01@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 17, 2022 7:13 AM

To: Reinhart, David <Reinhartd@cityoflacrosse.org>
Subject: Re: Shoveling Fees

*** CAUTION: This email originated from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe. ***

2030 Market St La Crose Wi

On Wed, Feb 16, 2022, 11:22 AM Reinhart, David <Reinhartd@cityoflacrosse.org> wrote:

Please provide the address in question and the reason for the dispute. After that is supplied this can be put on the
agenda.

Thanks.

David Reinhart

Chief Building Inspector

La Crosse Fire Department

Division of Community Risk Management
400 La Crosse St., La Crosse, WI. 54601

Office: 608-789-7564



From: Braden Busch <bradenbusch01@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 9:06 AM

To: Reinhart, David <Reinhartd@cityoflacrosse.org>
Subject: Shoveling Fees

*** CAUTION: This email originated from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe. ***

Hey,

I'm Braden (the guy who just called). | forgot specifically what | was supposed to tell you, just that | want to try to
appeal the charges. Bare minimum | think I'll need a payment plan if possible. Can you get me setup with the meeting

on Monday?

Thanks,

Braden



