Craig, Sondra

From: Pederson, Joseph

Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 2:54 PM
To: Craig, Sondra

Subject: FW: Riverfest Insurance Certificate

Sondra, please see response below, | am not sure how to proceed... if BPW can review and approve with these split
dates?

Joe Pederson

Parking Utility Coordinator

City of La Crosse

400 La Crosse St, La Crosse WI 54601
Office - (608)789-4908

Cell — (608)317-3886

From: byersonsps@aol.com <byersonsps@aol.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 2:49 PM

To: Pederson, Joseph <pedersonj@cityoflacrosse.org>
Subject: Fw: Riverfest Insurance Certificate

*** CAUTION: This email originated from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe. ***

Joe this is what | just received to answer your and the city's question

————— Forwarded Message -----

From: Candace Turk <cturk@heli-co.com>

To: byersonsps@aol.com <byersonsps@aol.com>
Cc: Justine Ellingson <jellingson@heli-co.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 at 02:39:51 PM CDT
Subject: RE: Riverfest Insurance Certificate

Marion —

Our insurance policy is currently in renewal with our broker and the same insurance will be renewed on July 1st, 2023.

We are planning on flying thru July 4" and will have the insurance policy with the new dates to you before we fly on July
2nd,

If the city would like direct information from our broker about insurance renewal dates | am more then happy to put them in
contact with our insurance broker.



| have reached out to our broker to see how quickly we can get the COI done once it is renewed.

Candace Turk | chief Financial Officer

Duluth: 218-461-2857|New Orleans: 504-291-8999

ASCENT wimmeon HELI CO.

AVIATION HELICOPTERS New ORLEANS

From: Candace Turk

Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 12:44 PM

To: byersonsps@aol.com

Cc: Justine Ellingson <jellingson@heli-co.com>
Subject: Riverfest Insurance Certificate

Marion —

Attached is the Riverfest COls which will renew July 15t 2023. Once we have the renewed COls | will send them over to
you right away.

Please let me know if you need anything else at this point.

Thank you

Candace Turk | Chief Financial Officer

Duluth: 218-461-2857|New Orleans: 504-291-8999

NEW ORLEANS



